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Reynoso, Ed

From: Kerri-Ann Richard <krichard@ers-inc.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2019 2:19 PM
To: Reynoso, Ed
Cc: Valenzuela, Keith (Contractor); Biermayer, Peter; Ramirez, Robert; Susan Haselhorst; 

Jaffe, Steven; Barnes, Jeff A; Nauta, Yvonne S.; Dee, Shanna; Smith, Collin
Subject: [EXTERNAL]  RE: WPA upload by SDG&E (WPSDGENRAG0001-Rev2 Sprinkler to Drip 

Irrigation)

Hi Ed, 
 
Please resubmit the tables so we can have the correct numbers when we review the tables and for the complete file on 
*.net. 
 
Thanks, 
 
Kerri-Ann Richard, C.E.M. 
Senior Consultant 
ERS 
120 Water Street, Suite 350 
North Andover, MA 01845-2648 
Direct: 978-332-5828 
Office: 978-521-2550 x266 
Mobile: 617-645-7298 
Fax: 978-521-4588 
krichard@ers-inc.com 
www.ers-inc.com 
 
 
 
 

From: Reynoso, Ed <EReynoso@semprautilities.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 12:48 PM 
To: Kerri-Ann Richard <krichard@ers-inc.com> 
Cc: Valenzuela, Keith (Contractor) <KValenzuela@seucontractor.com>; Biermayer, Peter 
<Peter.Biermayer@cpuc.ca.gov>; Ramirez, Robert <bob.ramirez@dnvgl.com>; Susan Haselhorst <shaselhorst@ers-
inc.com>; Jaffe, Steven <SJaffe@semprautilities.com>; Barnes, Jeff A <JBarnes@semprautilities.com>; Nauta, Yvonne S. 
<YNauta@semprautilities.com>; Dee, Shanna <SDee@semprautilities.com>; Smith, Collin 
<CRSmith@semprautilities.com> 
Subject: RE: WPA upload by SDG&E (WPSDGENRAG0001-Rev2 Sprinkler to Drip Irrigation) 
Importance: High 
 
Kerri-Ann,  
 
I’m writing to notify CPUC Staff and ex-ante team that we discovered measure/base cost errors in our ex-ante database 
submission for SDGE workpaper “WPSDGENRAG0001-Rev2 Sprinkler to Drip Irrigation”. The workpaper word document 
is correct but the cost table needs to be revised to align with the word documentation. The cost values were mistakenly 
transposed, as summarized in Table 1 below.  
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The correction has been addressed and corrected in our internal database, but need to know if SDG&E needs to re-
submit the tables to address this minor oversight. The given workpaper is a 2019 Phase 1 update, so the CPUC staff and 
ex-ante team have until 3/1/2019 to respond. I will post this email to WPA for historical preservation and consideration.  
 
Your response is greatly appreciated. Thank you  
 
Table 1: SDG&E revised Measure, Base and IMC Cost values 

Workpaper ID Cost ID Cost 
Value  (1/1/2019 
submission) 

Revised Cost 
Value 

WPSDGENRAG0001-
Rev2 

SDG_Agr-DripIrr 
SDG_Agr-Sprinkler_BASE 
IMC 

$168.00 
$448.00 
-$280.00 

$448 
$168 
$280 

 
Image 1: SDGE word document of Base, Measure and IMC 

 
 
 

From: Kerri-Ann Richard <krichard@ers-inc.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 19, 2018 7:32 AM 
To: Reynoso, Ed <EReynoso@semprautilities.com>; Susan Haselhorst <shaselhorst@ers-inc.com> 
Cc: Valenzuela, Kelvin <KValenzuela@semprautilities.com>; Valenzuela, Keith (Contractor) 
<KValenzuela@seucontractor.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: WPA upload by SDG&E (WPSDGENRAG0001-Rev2 Sprinkler to Drip Irrigation) 
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Hi Ed, 
 

1) Were you submitting this paper (Sprinkler to Drip) as a P2 for 2018 claims or for P1 2019? 
 

2) Were you intending to or have you already submitted WPSDGEREWH0024 R1? 
 

Regards, 
 
Kerri-Ann Richard, C.E.M. 
Senior Consultant 
ERS 
120 Water Street, Suite 350 
North Andover, MA 01845-2648 
Direct: 978-332-5828 
Office: 978-521-2550 x266 
Mobile: 617-645-7298 
Fax: 978-521-4588 
krichard@ers-inc.com 
www.ers-inc.com 
 
 
 
 

From: Reynoso, Ed <EReynoso@semprautilities.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 10, 2018 7:40 PM 
To: Kerri-Ann Richard <krichard@ers-inc.com>; Susan Haselhorst <shaselhorst@ers-inc.com> 
Cc: Valenzuela, Kelvin <KValenzuela@semprautilities.com>; Valenzuela, Keith (Contractor) 
<KValenzuela@seucontractor.com> 
Subject: WPA upload by SDG&E (WPSDGENRAG0001-Rev2 Sprinkler to Drip Irrigation) 
 
Kerri-Ann and Sue,  
 
I writing to notify the CPUC EAR team of SDG&E’s recent workpaper upload.  
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Eduardo “Ed” Reynoso, CEM, Contract Delegate | Progject Manager 
Energy Efficiency Technical Services | San Diego Gas & Electric 
           858-6541205 (Work) 

                619-676-7153 (Skype for Business) 

            www.sdge.com/save-money 
 

This email originated outside of Sempra Energy. Be cautious of attachments, web links, or requests for information. 

This email originated outside of Sempra Energy. Be cautious of attachments, web links, or requests for information. 


